




















































 

 
 

 
 
 
This document contains the procedure for dealing with Freedom of Information (FOI) 

requests for employees, councillors and members of the public.  

 
What is Freedom of Information? 
The Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOI) gives anyone the right of access to information 
held by Workington Town Council. The Council may refuse access to the information if that 
information falls within any of the exemptions under the FOI.  
 
The exemptions protect against the disclosure of information that would, for example, harm 
commercial interests, health and safety, audit functions, contain personal information and 
information provided in confidence.  
 
What can be requested? 
The right to ask for information will only relate to information held by the Council at the time 
the request is made. If the request relates to information received after the date it is made, a 
new FOI request must be completed. The term ‘information’ can be produced in any form, 
including paper document, computerised records, maps, plans etc. It is important to note that 
FOI legislation refers to ‘information’ rather than a record or document that contains that 
information. Therefore a request must contain an accurate description of the information 
required, in as much details as possible.  
 
Should a reason be provided to see the information? 
No, a request does not need to provide a reason why the information is required, however 
the Council must provide an explanation if the information is not available.  
 
Can a request under the Freedom of Information Act ask for personal information? 
No, a request for personal information about the individual must be made under the Data 
Protection Act 1998 and not FOI. 
 
Can a request ask for personal information about a third party? 
Personal Information relating to a third party will be dealt with under FOI. However, proof of 
the third party’s consent to the disclosure must be provided before you are given access to 
personal information. 
 
How should FOI requests be made? 
Requests must be in writing, including as much information as possible to enable the Council 
to identify and locate the information required. 
 
Requests should be addressed to: 
The Town Clerk 
Workington Town Council 
Town Hall 
Oxford Street 
Workington 
CA14 2RS 
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What are there limits to the information that can be requested? 
Workington Town Council can refuse an FOI request under confidentiality. Confidentiality is 
sometimes necessary to ensure the effectiveness of the Council’s decision making and to 
protect commercial interests. For these reasons, some categories of Council information are 
not covered by the commitment to provide information.  
 
The Council may also refuse a request if it is ambiguous or beyond the resources of Council 
to do so. If the request is ambiguous the Council will as far as practicable provide you with 
assistance to enable you to describe more clearly the information you are requesting. 
However, if the request places an extensive demand on the Councils resources, the 
Freedom of Information Act recognises that Council can refuse a request. The determination 
of this refusal is based on the cost of the number of hours it would take the authority to 
provide that information. The current limit on this cost is £450. Even if the information cannot 
be provided, the Town Council will be able to confirm whether or not it holds the information 
requested.  
 
In certain circumstances the Council may refuse your request for information if it is deemed 
vexatious. This can include repeated requests made with the aim of disrupting the 
operations of the Council. Nevertheless, it is the Council’s aim to ensure that information 
should be made available unless it is clearly not in the public interest to do so. All requests 
for information will be considered on their merits. 
 
What happens if the Council does not hold the information? 
The Council may not hold the information requested for a number of reasons. In such cases 
the individual will be informed that the Council does not hold the information and, if possible, 
will be informed where the Council believes that the information is held.   
 
How is information provided following a request?  
If the information is required in a specific format, this can be specified in the request. 
Information can also be viewed at the Town Council’s Office, the data and time of must 
however, be mutually agreed with the Town Clerk in advance.  
 
When must the information be provided?  
The Council will respond promptly to requests for information and in any event not later than 
on the 20th working day of the date of receipt of the written request. If it is not possible to 
provide the information within this time the Council will inform you.  
 
If a request is refused can an appeal be made against the Council's decision? 
If the individual is not satisfied with the decision they can request an internal review. This 
would be appropriate if the Council has refused the request or the individual considers that 
the request has not been handled properly and the issue cannot be resolved following 
discussion with the Town Clerk.   
 
A request for an internal review must be made with the Mayor of Workington and submitted 
within 4 weeks of the date of the decision.  
 
For further information or assistance on Freedom of Information 
More information about the Freedom of Information Act can be found at: 
https://www.gov.uk/make-a-freedom-of-information-request  
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2000/36/contents 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

  

Introduction 

Workington Town Council is accountable to the local community for its actions, which can 

only be achieved through effective communications.  The Town Council recognises that to 

increase public awareness of services and facilities, a constructive and positive relationship 

with the media is essential. The purpose of this policy is to define the roles and 

responsibilities within Workington Town Council for working with the media and a procedure 

on how to deal with issues that may arise when dealing with the media.  ‘Media’ is defined in 
this policy as the press, radio, TV broadcasting, and internet publications.  

 

1. Legal Responsibility 

1.1 The law governing communications in local authorities can be found in the Local 

Government Acts 1986 and 1988, The Freedom of Information Act 2000 and the 

Transparency Code 2015, as a minimum.  The Council must also have regard to the 

governments Code of Recommended Practice on Local Authority Publicity. 

 

1.2   The Town Council’s adopted Standing Orders should be adhered to. 

 

2. Contact with the Media 

2.1 The Town Clerk, employees and Members should always have due regard for the 

long term reputation of the Town Council in all their dealing with the media. 

 

2.2 Confidential documents, exempt Minutes, reports, papers and private 

correspondence should not be provided to the media.  If such instances do occur, an 

investigation will take place. 

 

2.3 When the media wish to discuss an issue that is, or is likely to be, subject to legal 

proceedings then advice should be taken from Workington Town Council’s solicitor 

before any response is made. 

 

2.4 In accordance with Data Protection and Freedom of Information legislation, instances 

that may involve the release of personal information or sensitive information must be 

dealt with by the Town Clerk.  

 

2.5 When responding to approaches from the media, statements made by the Town 

Clerk, employees and Members should reflect the Council’s opinion as resolved at 

Committee Meetings. 
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2.6 There are occasions when it is appropriate for the Town Council to submit a letter to 

the media in response to an issue, to explain policies etc. Such letters should be kept 

brief and balanced in tone and correspondence should not be drawn out over several 

weeks.   

 

2.7 Should a Member wish to submit a letter to the press on any subject they should not 

use the term ‘Town Council’ or give the impression, directly or implied, that they are 
writing on behalf of the Council.   

 

2.8 Any doubt about information that can or cannot be provided to the media can be 

clarified in Workington Town Council’s Data Protection Policy and Freedom of 
Information Procedures or with the Town Clerk. 

 

3. Attendance of Media at Council Meetings 

3.1 The Local Government Act 1972 requires the agendas, reports and minutes are sent 

to the media on request. 

 

3.2 The media are encouraged to attend Council meetings, seating and workspace will 

be made available. 

 

3.3 Any filming, taping or broadcasting of Council or Committee proceedings by the 

media must comply with current transparency guidelines. 

 

3.4 If a meeting is filmed the members of the media filming must ensure that: 

a) The activity does not disrupt the meeting 

b) The rights of those being filmed or broadcast are respected 

c) Any editing does not open to misinterpretation of the proceedings, or 

disrepute’s the core values of the Council.  
 

 3.5 Confidential sections of meetings are not covered by transparency regulations and 

may not be recorded or broadcast if doing so breaches the confidentiality of the 

session.  

 

4. Press Releases 

4.1 The purpose of a press release is to make the media aware of a potential story, to 

provide important public information or to explain the Town Council’s position on a 

particular issue.  It is the responsibility of the Town Clerk, employees and Members 

to look for opportunities where the issuing of a press release may be beneficial. 

 

5.  Elections 

The Code of Recommended Practice on Local Authority Publicity contains guidance for 
providing publicity for Members and for publicity during elections.  
 
5.1 The Town Council will not use resources to publicise individual Members unless it is 

relevant to the particular position they hold in the Council.  
 
 
 



 

 

5.2  The Council will not quote any Member in a news release or involve them in 

proactive publicity events during the election period, regardless of whether or not 

they are standing for election. The only exception to this (as laid down in the Code of 

Recommended Practice on Local Authority Publicity) is during an emergency or 

where there is a genuine need for a member level response to an important event 

outside the control of the Council. In this situation, Members holding key civic 

positions should be able to comment. 

 

6.  Notices 

6.1  The Town Council’s notice boards will be used for the advertising of agendas, 
minutes and other council information. 

 
6.3 The Town Council will use its notice boards to publicise local events and public 

information. Workington Town Council will authorise all publications prior to 
displaying it on any of the notice boards.  

 
6.4 The Town Council’s Matrix Boards will be used to advertise relevant non-profit events 

in Workington. Details on how the Matrix boards are used can be found in the Matrix 
Board Scheduling Policy. 

 
7. Social Media 
7.1 The Council’s website and Social Media platforms will be used to convey information 

on matters of interest and latest news.  

 

7.2 Social media sites are in the public domain and it is important that Members and 

employees ensure that they are confident of the nature of the information they 

publish.  

 

7.3 In their use of social media, Members and employees must at all times observe the 

principles stated in this policy. This includes content which may result in action for 

defamation, discrimination, breaches of copyright, data protection or other claims for 

damages that may bring the Council into disrepute.  

 



 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

This document contains the Data Protection procedure for employees, councillors and 

anyone working on behalf of Workington. This procedure has been written in conjunction 

with the Data Protection Act 1998 and Workington Town Council’s Data Protection Policy. All 

data described throughout this set of procedures covers personal and sensitive data. 

 

What Types of data are there? 

The Town Council holds and processes information about employees, councillors, residents 

and customers, and other data subjects for administrative and commercial purposes. This 

information will cover both personal and sensitive data. 

 

Personal data includes information that identifiable, such as addresses, phone numbers. 

Sensitive Data, on the other hand, is personal information. This can cover racial or ethnic 

origin, political opinion, religious or other beliefs, trade union membership, physical or mental 

health or condition, sexual orientation or criminal proceedings or convictions. 

 

The Data Protection Act ensures that both types of data are processed and stored in a way 

that protects the data from misuse and to protect the privacy of the individual. 

 

Processing Data 

The Data Protection Act sets out 8 principles for how employees, councillors and anyone 

working on behalf of Workington Town Council must processes and manage data. A 

summary of these can be found below.  

 

Data should:  

 be processed fairly and lawfully  

 be obtained for a specified and lawful purpose and should not be processed for any 

other purpose  

 be relevant and not excessive for the purpose  

 be accurate and up to date  

 not be kept for longer than necessary for the purpose  

 be processed within the individuals rights 

 be kept safe from unauthorised processing, and accidental loss, damage or 

destruction 

 not be transferred to a country outside the European Economic Area, unless that 

country has the equivalent levels of protection for personal data 
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Who is allowed to request data? 

Personal and sensitive data can be shared with the individual to whom it relates, this 

includes data that has been acquired through online sources. Requests for data must be 

made in writing to the Town Clerk. As an employee or Councillor you also have the right to 

ask the Town Council what information they hold about you.  

 

Data that can be requested under Data Protection can include: 

 what personal information the Council holds  

 what this information is used for  

 be provided with a copy of the information 

 the purposes for which the Council uses the information and any other persons 

organisations to whom it is disclosed 

 

How are Employees and Councillors Responsible? 

To comply with the Data Protection Act all employees and Councillors must ensure that all 

data is stored securely and is not disclosed accidentally or purposefully to an unauthorised 

person. This covers disclosing data both verbally or in writing.  

 

In order to avoid accidentally disclosing information it is important to conduct simple identity 

checks, this can be done over the telephone and face to face. If there are any queries about 

a person’s identity employees and Councillors must seek the advice of the Town Clerk prior 
to disclosing any information.  

 

Employees and Councillors must be considerate when disclosing any information via email. 

Employees must ensure that emails contain no personal or sensitive information that the 

recipients should not have access to.  When sending emails to large mailing lists it is 

advisable to use the ‘Blind Carbon Copy’ to prevent disclosing email addresses to third 
parties.  

 

From time to time instances may arise which may require the disclosure of personal 

information to a third party, e.g. the Police. These queries must be passed to the clerk for 

consideration on a case by case basis. 

 

How can I store Data effectively? 

All personal and sensitive data should be kept in either paper based or electronic filing 

systems. To ensure that data is secure paper documentation must be kept in lockable 

storage, while electronic data must be password protected. 

 

Disposing of Data 

All documentation that contains personal and sensitive data must be disposed of using 

shredding facilities. This includes any details written on scrap pieces of paper such as 

names and telephone numbers. 

 

Data can be held for different lengths of time depending on its use. As a rule, unless data 

relates to financial information it should not be stored for longer than it is required. 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

Who is responsible for monitoring and enforcing Data Protection? 

The Town Clerk, who acts on behalf of the Council, is responsible for maintaining and 

enforcing Data Protection on behalf of Workington Town Council. This includes checking 

how long data has been and should be held, implementing security measures to protect data 

and ensuring that everyone managing and handling personal information does so correctly.  

 

What will happen if Data Protection is not adhered to? 

All councillors and members of staff should follow these procedures and adhere to the Data 

Protection Policy when processing and managing data. Employees and Councillors may be 

subject to disciplinary or legal action where appropriate.  

 

Under the Data Protection Act it is a criminal offence to disclose personal information 

‘knowingly or recklessly’ to anyone who is not authorised to receive it. 
 

If any individual queries whether the Council has breached any of the requirements of the 

Data Protection Act 1998, they should be must raise their concerns with the Town Clerk or 

Mayor. 

 

Subject Access Request 

Everyone should be able to identify a Subject Access Request, and know how to respond. 

The inquiry should be passed to the Data protection Officer, who will usually be the Town 

Clerk. The DPO will assess the extent of the request, and correspond with the applicant if 

there is any need for clarification or confirmation of identity. The Council has 30 days to 

respond to the applicant, unless it finds cause to require an extension to this period for up to 

60 days. The applicant must be told in reasonable time within the initial 30 days if this is the 

case. The GDPR Toolkit (NALC, July 2018 Appendix 7) outlines the process in more detail. 

 

The Council retains personal data as email, Facebook entries and in allotment records. 

There is also some limited financial information retained in invoices and payment details. It is 

advisable to notify all appropriate staff that there is a SAR and that the DPO any requires 

information relating to the Applicant printed out within 10 days of the request.  

 

The DPO must ascertain from the applicant how they would like to receive the data. The 

usual guidance is that it should be by pdf if the inquiry is electronic, or in paper form if the 

inquiry was made by post. 

 

SAR added 26 July 2019 




